[111th Congress Public Law 11]
[From the U.S. Government Printing Office]

[[Page 123 STAT. 991]]

Public Law 111-11
111th Congress

An Act

To designate certain land as components of the National Wilderness
Preservation System, to authorize certain programs and activities in the
Department of the Interior and the Department of Agriculture, and for
other purposes. <<NOTE: Mar. 30, 2009 - [H.R. 146]>>

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States of America in Congress assembled, <<NOTE: Omnibus Public
Land Management Act of 2009. 16 USC 1 note.>>
Subtitle B--Project Authorizations

Sec. 9101. Tumalo Irrigation District Water Conservation Project,
Oregon.

Sec. 9102. Madera Water Supply Enhancement Project, California.

Sec. 9103. Eastern New Mexico Rural Water System project, New Mexico.

Sec. 9104. Rancho California Water District project, California.

Sec. 9105. Jackson Gulch Rehabilitation Project, Colorado.

Sec. 9106. Rio Grande Pueblos, New Mexico.

Sec. 9107. Upper Colorado River endangered fish programs.

Sec. 9108. Santa Margarita River, California.

Sec. 9109. Elsinore Valley Municipal Water District.

Sec. 9110. North Bay Water Reuse Authority.

Sec. 9111. Prado Basin Natural Treatment System Project, California.

Sec. 9112. Bunker Hill Groundwater Basin, California.

Sec. 9113. GREAT Project, California.

Sec. 9114. Yucaipa Valley Water District, California.

Sec. 9115. Arkansas Valley Conduit, Colorado.

SEC. 9107. UPPER COLORADO RIVER ENDANGERED FISH PROGRAMS.
(a) Definitions- Section 2 of Public Law 106-392 (114 Stat. 1602) is amended--

(1) in paragraph (5), by inserting ", rehabilitation, and repair' after “and
replacement’; and



(2) in paragraph (6), by inserting “those for protection of critical habitat,
those for preventing entrainment of fish in water diversions,' after
“instream flows,'".
(b) Authorization To Fund Recovery Programs- Section 3 of Public Law 106-392
(114 Stat. 1603; 120 Stat. 290) is amended--
(1) in subsection (a)--
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking "$61,000,000" and inserting
"$88,000,000';
(B) in paragraph (2), by striking "2010" and inserting "2023'"; and
(C) in paragraph (3), by striking "2010' and inserting "2023";
(2) in subsection (b)--
(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by striking
"$126,000,000' and inserting “$209,000,000';
(B) in paragraph (1)--
(i) by striking "$108,000,000" and inserting "$179,000,000';
and
(ii) by striking "2010" and inserting "2023"; and
(C) in paragraph (2)--
(i) by striking "$18,000,000' and inserting “$30,000,000;
and
(ii) by striking “2010' and inserting "2023"; and
(3) in subsection (c)(4), by striking "$31,000,000' and inserting
"$87,000,000'.



